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 Paris Adieu is a coming-of-age tale of life lessons, romance, and self-empowerment all wrapped in the
sights, sounds, and smells of Paris. The first time Ava Fodor visits Paris as a nineteen-year old au pair, she
has no idea who she is. Paris introduces Ava to the type of woman she'd like to become. Her French
boyfriend introduces her to the concept of being comfortable in her own skin. She's intrigued. If only she
knew how... When she gets into Yale, she returns home, but four years later she's back for an encounter with
a Frenchman that awakens her to womanhood. If only she could stay... Five years later, Ava returns to Paris
as a singer/pianist. She meets Arnaud, a foreign correspondent, who captures her heart, but tortures her with
long absences. While he's away, she throws herself into songwriting where she achieves an authenticity she
doesn't feel onstage. With the help of Arnaud's childhood friend Pierre, who appreciates Ava's original songs
in a way Arnaud doesn't, Ava takes the reins of her own future. Armed with the lessons Paris has taught her,
she bids adieu to Arnaud, Pierre and her very first love--the City of Light. But will the one man who truly
understands her follow?

Paris Adieu is Part I of The Ava Series, Ava Fodor's journey of self discovery, continued in Black is Not a
Color.
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From reader reviews:

Ruth Frye:

What do you regarding book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you want
something to explain what the one you have problem? How about your time? Or are you busy man? If you
don't have spare time to do others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have free time? What
did you do? Everybody has many questions above. They should answer that question since just their can do
this. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is proper. Because start from on jardín
de infancia until university need this specific Paris Adieu to read.

Ruth Haddock:

The e-book with title Paris Adieu has lot of information that you can learn it. You can get a lot of profit after
read this book. This particular book exist new understanding the information that exist in this guide
represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u to find out how the improvement
of the world. This kind of book will bring you with new era of the internationalization. You can read the e-
book on the smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you want.

Joseph Cole:

This Paris Adieu is new way for you who has intense curiosity to look for some information since it relief
your hunger info. Getting deeper you upon it getting knowledge more you know otherwise you who still
having little digest in reading this Paris Adieu can be the light food for you because the information inside
this particular book is easy to get through anyone. These books develop itself in the form which can be
reachable by anyone, yep I mean in the e-book form. People who think that in publication form make them
feel tired even dizzy this guide is the answer. So there is absolutely no in reading a book especially this one.
You can find actually looking for. It should be here for you actually. So , don't miss this! Just read this e-
book type for your better life in addition to knowledge.

Michael Madden:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our know-how for everything. By a book we can know
everything we really wish for. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year
ended up being exactly added. This e-book Paris Adieu was filled regarding science. Spend your extra time
to add your knowledge about your scientific disciplines competence. Some people has distinct feel when
they reading a new book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you can sense enjoy to read a book. In
the modern era like at this point, many ways to get book which you wanted.
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